ANNUAL BID #2660 - UNIFORMS: SHERIFF

AS PER BIDS RECEIVED ON NOVEMBER 17, 2009 AT 10:00 AM

FROM: JANUARY4 2010 TO: DECEMBE

'S / JAILER/ INMATES.

TABULATION

R 31,2010 W/ OPTION TO RENEW ONCE OR TWICE ONE (1)

ADDITIONAL YEAR W/ EACH RENEWAL.

BIDDER'S NAME LONE STAR UNIFORMS UNFIRMS MANUFACTURING, INC. BOB BARKER CO, CHARM TEX
AND YEARLY P.O. BOX 692348, P.O. BOX 12716, 134 N. MAIN ST., 1618 CONEY ISLAND AVENUE,
ADDRESS | APPROX HOUSTON, TX. 77269-2348 SCOTTSDALE, AZ. 85267 FUQUAY VARIN, N.C. 27526 BROOKLYN, N.Y, 11230
DESCRIPTION Qry. (832)237-8000 (480) 368-9316 (800)334-0880 (718) 252-8100
. ) UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRIC! UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE
A. PATROL UNIFORMS e L i ’ _
A-1. Shirts - Short Sleeve 210 $41.90 ———n $8,799.00/  NOBID NO BID NOBID __NOBID NO BID NO BID
A-2. Shirts - Long Sleeve 210 $43.90 —— $9,219.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NOBID NO BID
A-3. Slacks 210 $39.90 —— $8,379.00]  NOBID NO BID NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID

A, TOTAL ] ———>  $26,397.00 NO BID ' NO BID ) NQ BID
B. JAIL GUARDS , ] . .

B-1. Shirts - Short Sleeve 330 $39.90 ——  $13167.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
B-2. Shirts - Long Sleeve 50 $43.90 ——+  $219500 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NOBID NO BID
B-3, Pants ] 60 $20.90 ———  $1,794.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

B. TOTAL T $17,156.00 NOBID ) NO BID NO BID

C. INMATE COVERALLS & -

UNIFORMS

C-1, Coveralls .
White, Dark Blue (S-XL) 70 NO BID NO BID $9.33 $653,10 $10.30 $721.00 $12.36 $865,20
White, Dark Blue (2X) 5 NO BID NO BID $9.33 $46.65 $11.25 $56.25 $12.36 _$61.80
Orange, Green (S-XL) 600 NO BID NO BID $10.00 $6,000.00 $10.30 $6,180.00 $12.36 $7.416.00
Orange, Green (2X) 100 NO BID NO BID $10.00 $1,000,00 $11.25 $1,125.00 $12.36 $1,236.00
Red, Silver, Tan (S-XL) 15 NO BID NO BID $10.40 $156.00 $10.30 $154.50 $12.36 $185.40
Red, Siiver, Tan (2X) 10 NO BID NO BID $10.40 $104.00 $11.25 $1,125.00 $12.36 $123.60]

c -2, V-Neck Shirts . ] .

Orange, Red, Green (S-2X) 10 NO BID NO BID _$4.15 $41.50 $3.90 $39.00 $5.54 - $55.40
White, Blue, Sliver, Tan (S-2X) 150 NO BID NO BID $4.35 $652.50 $3.90 $585.00 $5.54 $831.00
C-3. Work Pants ] o ] _ By

Orange, Red, Green (S-2X) 10 NO BID NO BID $4.90 $49.00 $4.95 $49.50 $5.54 $55.40
White, Blue, Silver, Tan (S-2X) 150 NQ BID NO BID $4.40 $660.00 $4.95 $742.50 $5.54 _$831.00

C. _ TOTAL NO BID NO BID . ———>  $9,362.75 $10,777.75 $11,660.80
D. INMATE SANDALS SHR. 2000 NOBID NO.BID $1.89 $3,780.00 _$1.48 $2,960.00 $143 ———  $2:860.00
E. PATROL JACKETS i 20 $99.00 —— 3198000 | NOBID NO BID NO BID NOBID NO BID
MISC. DISCOUNT OFF LIST ' 20% 35% ‘ 3% 2%
RECOMMENDATION ~ — W /% Cree £o67, z/z =~ /97
ERTIFY THE ABOVE TO BE THE COR!TEC BIDS RECEIVED. (o10) Arﬂy / /7
-
MICHAEL FORBES, PURCHASING AGENT DATE' JAVIER HRPNA DATE
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TABULATION

ANNUAL BID #2660 - UNIFORMS: SHERIFF'S / JAILER/ INMATES.
AS PER BIDS RECEIVED ON NOVEMBER 17, 2009 AT 10:00 AM

FROM: JANUARY 4, 2010 TO: DECEMBER 31, 2010 W/ OPTION TO RENEW ONCE OR TWICE ONE (1) ADDITIONAL YEAR W/ EACH RENEWAL.

BIDDER'S NAME i 1.C.S.
AND YEARLY P.O. BOX 210586,
ADDRESS . APPROX WACO, TX, 76702
DESCRIPTION Qry. | . (800) 524-5427
) ) UNIT PRICE S TOTAL PRICE]
A. PATROL UNIFORMS i . )
A-1. Shirts - Short Sleeve 210 NQ BID NO BID
A-2. Shirts - Long, Sleeve i 210 NO BID NO BID
A-3, Slacks 210 NOBID NO BID
A, TOTAL ] L NO BID
B. JAIL GUARDS ] ] ] )
B-1. Shirts - Short Sleave 330 NO BID NOBID
B-2. Shists - Long Sleeve 50 NO BID MO BID
B-3, Pafts ] 60 NO BiD NO BID
B, TOTAL ] - NOBID
C. INMATE COVERALLS & ' ‘
UNIFORMS
C-1. Coveralls ) ! .
White, Dark Blue (S-XL) 70 $14.00 $080.00
White, Dark Blue (2X) ] $14.00 $70.00
Orange, Green (§-XL) 600 $14.00 $8,400.00
Orange, Greet (2X) 100 $14.00 $1,400.00
Red, Silver, Tan (S-XL) | 18 | $14.00 $210.00 |
Red, Sliver, Tan (2X), 10 $14.00 $140.00
C-2., V-Neck Shitts ' )
Orange, Red, Green (S-2X) 10 $7.00 $70.00
White, Biue, Siiver, Tan (S-2X) 150 ), $7.00 $1,050.00
C-3. Work Pants |, - N
Orange, Red, Green(S-2X) 1 10 - $7.00 ) $_70.0Q
Whits, Blue, Sliver, Tan (S-2X) 150 . | $7.00 ) $1,050.00
c.. TYOTAaL .. . — s $13440,00 - 7 W V> /2 2 /o5
D. INMATE SANDALS SHR. | 2000 | $1.85 $3,700.00 . M
E. PATROL JACKETS , 20 | NOBID NOBID | 7/
MISC, DISCOUNT OFF LIST o ] 10%

RECOMMENDATION —

ON:

-

{HE ERTIFY THE ABOVE TO BE THE CO RECT BIDS RECEIVED.  RECOM /X’w
ﬁ l2/13 /04

MlCHAEL FORBES, PURCHASING AGENT |/ DATE JAww UDATE' TAIKE LIENART v / SATE
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