TABULATION

PICK-UP TRUCKS (QTY. 14) SUVs (QTY. 4)
AS PER BIDS RECEIVED ON: FEBRUARY 12, 2019 AT 11:00 A.M.

VENDOR'S NAME BOGGUS FORD BOSWELL ELLIFF FORD CALDWELL COUNTRY GRAPEVINE DODGE
& 2521 A. SO. EXPRESSWAY, | 1401 W. BUS. HWY, 77 P.O. BOX 27, 2601 WILLIAM TATE,
ADDRESS HARLINGEN, TX. 78550 SAN BENITO, TX, 78586 CALDWELL, TX, 77836 GRAPEVINE, TX. 76051
DESCRIPTION (956) 423-2580 (956) 399-2468 (979)567-6116 (817) 410-7541
DESCRIPTION TOTAL PRICE TOTAL PRICE TOTAL PRICE TOTAL PRICE
A. SUVs MID SIZE {(QTY, 2) Dist Clerk & Healh NQ BID —» $51,060.00 $58,700.00 $52.684.00
B. SUVs FULL SIZE (QTY. 2) Auditor & Bridge $72,937.04 — $72,600.00 573,350.00 NO BID
C. PICK-UP TRUCKS Crew Cab 3/4 Ton Short B 4 X 4 (QTY, 2) Bldg. Maint. $60.228.06 — $59,300.00 NO BID $71,800.00
D. PICK-UP TRUCK Crew Cab 3/4 Ton- Diesel- Short B4 X 4 (OTY. 1) CP4 $37.669.68 — $37.200.00 NO BID $43,311.00
E. PICK-UP TRUCK Crew Cab 3/4 Ton Long B 4 X 4 (QTY. 1) Pub W P3 $30.294.93 — $29.900.00 NO BID $35,298.00
F_PIGK-UP TRUCK Gompact EXt. Cab Shorl B (QTY. 1) Eng. DOT NO BID $22,800.00 $23.775.00 —>  §20.720.00
G PICK-UP TRUCK Extendad Caly 1/2 Ton Long B 4 X 4 (QTY. 1} Enviro Health $27.327.04 —» 27300.00 *1 NO BID $26,778.00 *2
H. PICK-UP TRUCKS Crew Cab 1/2 Ton Long B4 X 4 (QTY. 8) Tax1-Parks1-
PubWorks5 --CP3J — $230,853.20 "1 $230,950.00 $239,800.00 $230,664.00 *2
A. DELIVERY / DAYS NO BID IN STOCK 120 80-100
B. DELIVERY ! DAYS 105 360-90 90-120 NO BID
C. DELIVERY / DAYS 98 60-90 NO BID 150-180
D. DELIVERY / DAYS 98 60-90 NO BID 150-180
E. DELlVERY_i' DAYS 98 60-80 NO BID 150-180
F. DELIVERY / DAYS NO BID 60-90 90-120 70-100
| G, DELIVERY / DAYS 84 60-90 NO BID 75-100
H. DELIVERY / DAYS 84 60-90 90-120 75-100
RECOMMENDATION —>
*1 . Low Local - within 3% of low bid
*2 - Low Bid
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Awarded by Commissioner's Court 3/4/2019




