

TABULATION

ANNUAL BID # 2580 - ROAD SURFACING MATERIALS
 AS PER BIDS RECEIVED ON JANUARY 29, 2019 AT 11:00 A.M.
 FROM MARCH 10, 2019 TO MARCH 10, 2020 WITH OPTION TO RENEW ONCE OR TWICE FOR ONE (1) ADDITIONAL YEAR WITH EACH RENEWAL.
 OPEN MARKET (COST ONLY) PRICE INCREASES ALLOWED

BIDDER'S NAME AND ADDRESS	VULCAN MATERIALS P O BOX 791550, SAN ANTONIO, TX 78279 (210) 524-3587	MARTIN MARIETTA 5710 W HAUSMAN RD., SR 121 SAN ANTONIO, TX 78249 (210) 208-4085	UPPER VALLEY MATERIALS 3699 W PALMA VISTA DRIVE, PALMVIEW, TX 78572 (956) 437-0000	FRONTERA MATERIALS P O BOX 1449, ELSA, TX 78543 (956) 316-8962
A) HOT MIX ASPHALTIC CONCRETE	PER/TON	PER/TON	PER/TON	PER/TON
1. Type "D" - Gravel/Limestone Paving & Speed Humps				
(1) Zone 1	NO BID	NO BID	\$70.95	\$57.40
(2) Zone 2	NO BID	NO BID	\$70.95	\$54.65
(3) Zone 3	NO BID	NO BID	\$67.35	\$56.50
(4) Zone 4	NO BID	NO BID	\$67.35	\$57.90
(5) Zone 5	NO BID	NO BID	\$70.50	\$53.50
(6) Hold for package	NO BID	NO BID	\$50.00	
B) LIMESTONE ROCK ASPHALT (CLASS A)	PER/TON	PER/TON	PER/TON	PER/TON
1. Type "CG" - natural cold - coarse				
(a) Public Works Brownsville P1	\$91.64	\$96.19	NO BID	NO BID
(b) Public Works Brownsville P2	\$91.04	\$93.01	NO BID	NO BID
(c) Public Works San Benito P3	\$88.44	\$91.27	NO BID	NO BID
(d) Public Works Harlingen P4	\$87.46	\$91.50	NO BID	NO BID
(e) Zone 1	\$87.48	\$93.01	NO BID	NO BID
(f) Zone 2	\$88.44	\$93.01	NO BID	NO BID
(g) Zone 3	\$88.70	\$93.01	NO BID	NO BID
(h) Zone 4	\$90.20	\$93.01	NO BID	NO BID
(i) Zone 5	\$91.64	\$93.01	NO BID	NO BID
2. TYPE "D" - natural cold - fines				
(a) Public Works Brownsville P1 & P2	\$94.64	\$95.17	NO BID	NO BID
(b) Public Works San Benito	\$91.44	\$93.27	NO BID	NO BID
(c) Public Works Harlingen	\$90.46	\$91.04	NO BID	NO BID
(d) Zone 1	\$90.48	\$91.00	NO BID	NO BID
(e) Zone 2	\$91.44	\$92.00	NO BID	NO BID
(f) Zone 3	\$91.76	\$93.00	NO BID	NO BID
(g) Zone 4	\$93.20	\$94.00	NO BID	NO BID
(h) Zone 5	\$94.64	\$95.00	NO BID	NO BID

RECOMMENDATION BY COUNTY ENGINEER:

I HEREBY CERTIFY THE ABOVE TO BE THE CORRECT BIDS RECEIVED
 MICHAEL VERBURG, ASST. AUDITOR / PURCHASING DATE: 2/18/19

Paulina Vega
 PAULINA VEGA COUNTY ENGINEER DATE

Carlos Reyes
 CARLOS REYES PUBLIC WORKS SUPERVISOR DATE

Awarded by Commissioner's Court 2/18/2019

TABULATION

ANNUAL BID # 2859 - ROAD SURFACING MATERIALS
 AS PER BIDS RECEIVED ON JANUARY 29, 2019 AT 9:00 A.M.
 FROM: MARCH 15, 2019 TO MARCH 15, 2020 WITH OPTION TO RENEW ONCE OR TWICE FOR ONE (1) ADDITIONAL YEAR WITH EACH RENEWAL.
 OPEN MARKET (COST ONLY) PRICE INCREASES ALLOWED

BIDDER'S NAME AND ADDRESS	VULCAN MATERIALS P.O. BOX 791550, SAN ANTONIO, TX 78279 (210) 524-3567	MARTIN MARRETTA 6710 W HAUSMAN RD. SR 121 SAN ANTONIO, TX 78249 (210) 208-4085	UPPER VALLEY MATERIALS 3609 W PALMA VISTA DRIVE, PALMVIEW, TX 78672 (068) 432-0600	FRONTIER MATERIALS P O BOX 1449, ELSA, TX 78543 (358) 318-8952
C. AGGREGATE FOR SURFACE TREATMENTS				
1 Type P.E. Grade 3	PER TON	PER TON	PER TON	PER TON
(a) Zone 1	\$73.48	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
(b) Zone 2	\$74.44	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
(c) Zone 3	\$74.76	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
(d) Zone 4	\$76.90	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
(e) Zone 5	\$77.64	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
2 Type P.E. Grade 4 Non-Castle Aggregate	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$35.00
(a) Zone 1	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$35.00
(b) Zone 2	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$38.00
(c) Zone 3	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$40.00
(d) Zone 4	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$40.00
(e) Zone 5	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
3 Type P.E. Grade 5	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
(a) Zone 1	\$74.48	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
(b) Zone 2	\$75.44	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
(c) Zone 3	\$75.76	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
(d) Zone 4	\$77.20	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
(e) Zone 5	\$78.64	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
4 Type P.E. Grade 5 Non-Castle Aggregate	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
(a) Zone 1	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
(b) Zone 2	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
(c) Zone 3	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
(d) Zone 4	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
(e) Zone 5	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID

RECOMMENDATION BY COUNTY ENGINEER: _____

Paulina Vega
 PAULINA VEGA COUNTY ENGINEER DATE _____

I HEREBY CERTIFY THE ABOVE TO BE THE CORRECT BIDS RECEIVED:
Michael Forbes
 MICHAEL FORBES PURCHASING AGENT DATE 2/15/19

Carlos Reyes
 CARLOS REYES PUBLIC WORKS SUPERVISOR DATE _____

Awarded by Commissioner's Court 2/18/2019

TABULATION
SECONDARY (BACK-UP) SUPPLIER

ANNUAL BID # 2540 - ROAD SURFACING MATERIALS
AS PER BIDS RECEIVED ON JANUARY 29, 2019 AT 11:00 A.M.
FROM: MARCH 15, 2019 TO MARCH 15, 2020 W/ OPTION TO RENEW ONCE OR TWICE FOR ONE (1) ADDITIONAL YEAR WITH EACH RENEWAL.
OPEN MARKET (COST ONLY) PRICE INCREASES ALLOWED

BIDDER'S NAME AND ADDRESS	VULCAN MATERIALS P.O. BOX 791690, SAN ANTONIO, TX 78279 (210) 524-3597	MARTIN MARIETTA 5710 W HAUSMAN RD., S# 121 SAN ANTONIO TX 78248 (210) 208-4085	UPPER VALLEY MATERIALS 2663 W PALMA VISTA DRIVE, PALMVIEW, TX. 78072 (359) 432-0809	FRONTIERA MATERIALS P O BOX 1440, ELSA, TX 78543 (956) 316-8952
A HOT MIX- ASPHALTIC CONCRETE	PERITON	PERITON	PERITON	PERITON
1. Type "D" - Gravel / Limestone "Paving & Speed Humps"				
(1) Zone 1	NO BID	NO BID	\$73.95	\$83.49
(2) Zone 2	NO BID	NO BID	\$73.95	\$84.05
(3) Zone 3	NO BID	NO BID	\$70.35	\$80.50
(4) Zone 4	NO BID	NO BID	\$70.35	\$87.90
(5) Zone 5	NO BID	NO BID	\$73.50	\$87.90
(6) Held for pick-up	NO BID	NO BID	\$82.00	\$83.90

RECOMMENDATION BY COUNTY ENGINEER:

PAOLINA VEGA COUNTY ENGINEER DATE

I HEREBY CERTIFY THE ABOVE TO BE THE CORRECT BIDS RECEIVED:
MICHAEL FORBES, PURCHASING AGENT DATE 2/15/19

CARLOS REYES PUBLIC WORKS SUPERVISOR DATE

Page 3

Awarded by Commissioner's Court 2/18/2019