

## TABULATION

ANNUAL BIDS # 2520 - ROAD DRAINAGE MATERIALS  
 AS PER BIDS RECEIVED ON JANUARY 29, 2019 AT 11:00 A.M.  
 FROM: MARCH 16, 2019 TO: MARCH 15, 2020 W/OPTION TO RENEW ONCE OR TWICE FOR ONE ADDITIONAL YEAR WITH EACH RENEWAL  
 OPEN MARKET (COST ONLY) PRICE INCREASES ALLOWED

VENDOR'S NAME ADDRESS DESCRIPTION		CONTECH ENGINEERED SOLUTIONS 232 OAKLAND RD., SCHULENBURG, TX. 78956 (512) 680-1772		RIO VALLEY PIPE dba CAPA 3609 W. PALMA VISTA DRIVE, PALMVIEW, TX. 78572 (956) 580-2502	
A	CORRUGATED METAL PIPE, ASPHALT COATED DELIVERED TO THE JOB SITE		PRICE PER L.F.		PRICE PER L.F.
	(1) 18" X 2 2/3 X 1/2" CORRUGATIONS - 16 G	→	\$ 18.72		NO BID
	(2) 24" X 2 2/3 X 1/2" CORRUGATIONS - 16 G	→	\$ 23.40		NO BID
	(3) 30" X 2 2/3 X 1/2" CORRUGATIONS - 16 G	→	\$ 29.45		NO BID
	(4) 36" X 2 3/4 X 1/2" CORRUGATIONS - 14 G	→	\$ 43.29		NO BID
	(5) 48" X 2 2/3 X 1/2" CORRUGATIONS - 14 G	→	\$ 58.50		NO BID
	(6) 60" X 2 2/3 X 1/2" CORRUGATIONS - 12 G	→	\$ 97.11		NO BID
	(7) 72" X 3" X 1" CORRUGATIONS - 12 G	→	\$ 152.55		NO BID
	(8) 84" X 3" X 1" CORRUGATIONS - 12 G	→	\$ 176.85		NO BID
	(9) 96" X 3" X 1" CORRUGATIONS - 10G	→	\$ 203.85		NO BID
	(10) # BAND COUPLER COMPLETE W/ BOLTS		PRICE PER EACH		PRICE PER EACH
	(A) 18" /	→	\$ 62.00		NO BID
	(B) 24" /	→	\$ 69.25		NO BID
	(C) 30" /	→	\$ 77.25		NO BID
	(D) 36" /	→	\$ 89.00		NO BID
	(E) 48" /	→	\$ 113.00		NO BID
	(F) 60" /	→	\$ 272.25		NO BID
	(G) 72" /	→	\$ 717.50		NO BID
	(H) 84" /	→	\$ 775.00		NO BID
	(I) 96" /	→	\$ 850.00		NO BID

RECOMMENDATION →

CONTECH Freight - \$1,500 per Truck load

I HEREBY CERTIFY THE ABOVE TO BE THE CORRECT PROPOSALS RECEIVED:

 2/5/19  
 MICHAEL FORBES, PURCHASING AGENT DATE

  
 PAOLINA VEGA - COUNTY ENGINEER DEPT. DATE

  
 CARLOS REYES - PUBLIC WORKS SUPV.

Awarded by Commissioner's Court 2/18/2019

## TABULATION



ANNUAL BIDS # 2520 - ROAD DRAINAGE MATERIALS  
 AS PER BIDS RECEIVED ON JANUARY 29, 2019 AT 11:00 A.M.  
 FROM: MARCH 16, 2019 TO: MARCH 16, 2020 W/OPTION TO RENEW ONCE OR TWICE FOR ONE ADDITIONAL YEAR WITH EACH RENEWAL  
 OPEN MARKET (COST ONLY) PRICE INCREASES ALLOWED

VENDOR'S NAME ADDRESS DESCRIPTION		CONTECH ENGINEERED SOLUTIONS RIO VALLEY PIPE dba CAPA 232 OAKLAND RD., 3609 W. PALMA VISTA DRIVE, SCHULENBURG, TX. 78956 PALMVIEW, TX. 78572 (512) 680-1772 (958) 580-2502	
B	CONCRETE PIPE W/JOINTING MATERIALS TO REINFORCED T & G - CLASS III	PRICE PER L.F.	PRICE PER L.F.
	(A) 18" / X 8 L.F.	NO BID	→ \$ 18.40
	(B) 24" / X 8 L.F.	NO BID	→ \$ 28.00
	(C) 30" / X 8 L.F.	NO BID	→ \$ 39.63
	(D) 36" / X 8 L.F.	NO BID	→ \$ 54.37
	(E) 42" / X 8 L.F.	NO BID	→ \$ 73.98
	(F) 48" / X 8 L.F.	NO BID	→ \$ 93.21
	(G) 54" / X 8 L.F.		→ \$ 109.49
C	CONCRETE PIPE REINFORCED GASKET (Flex Joint)- CLASS III	PRICE PER L.F.	PRICE PER L.F.
	A) 18" X 8 L.F.	NO BID	→ \$ 20.79
	B) 24" X 8 L.F.	NO BID	→ \$ 29.12
	C) 30" X 8 L.F.	NO BID	→ \$ 43.08
	D) 36" X 8 L.F.	NO BID	→ \$ 60.81
	E) 42" X 8 L.F.	NO BID	→ \$ 80.77
	F) 48" X 8 L.F.	NO BID	→ \$ 93.02
	G) 54" X 8 L.F.	NO BID	→ \$ 110.82
	H) 60" X 8 L.F.	NO BID	→ \$ 138.97
	I) 72" X 8 L.F.	NO BID	→ \$ 191.90

RECOMMENDATION →  
 CONTECH Freight - \$1,500 per Truck load

I HEREBY CERTIFY THE ABOVE TO BE THE CORRECT PROPOSALS RECEIVED:

  
 MICHAEL FORGES, PURCHASING AGENT DATE 2/5/19

  
 PAOLINA VEGA - COUNTY ENGINEER DEPT. DATE  
  
 CARLOS REYES, PUBLIC WORKS SUPV.

Awarded by Commissioner's Court 2/18/2019


## TABULATION



ANNUAL BIDS # 2520 - ROAD DRAINAGE MATERIALS  
 AS PER BIDS RECEIVED ON JANUARY 29, 2019 AT 11:00 A.M.  
 FROM: MARCH 16, 2019 TO: MARCH 15, 2020 W/OPTION TO RENEW ONCE OR TWICE FOR ONE ADDITIONAL YEAR WITH EACH RENEWAL  
 OPEN MARKET (COST ONLY) PRICE INCREASES ALLOWED

VENDOR'S NAME ADDRESS DESCRIPTION		CONTECH ENGINEERED SOLUTIONS 232 OAKLAND RD., SCHULENBURG, TX. 78956 (512) 680-1772	RIO VALLEY PIPE dba CAPA 3609 W. PALMA VISTA DRIVE, PALMVIEW, TX. 78572 (956) 580-2502
D.	CONCRETE DRAIN INLETS TYPE "AA" TO CONFORM W/ASTM C-478	PRICE PER EACH	PRICE PER EACH
	A) 3' X 5' X 3'	NO BID	→ \$ 908.98
	B) 3' X 5' X 4'	NO BID	→ \$ 968.58
	C) 3' X 5' X 5'	NO BID	→ \$ 1,079.06
	D) 3' X 5' X 6'	NO BID	→ \$ 1,224.10
	E) 3' X 5' X 7'	NO BID	→ \$ 1,363.59
	F) 3' X 5' X 8'	NO BID	→ \$ 1,483.68
	G) TYPE "AA" INLET TOP W/ SIDEWALK RING & COVER	NO BID	→ \$ 494.50
E.	CONCRETE DRAIN INLETS TYPE "CC" TO CONFORM W/ASTM C-478	PRICE PER EACH	PRICE PER EACH
	A) 3' X 6' X 3' W/ 2 grates	NO BID	→ \$ 1,268.09
	B) 3' X 5' X 4' W/ 2 grates	NO BID	→ \$ 1,304.08
	C) 3' X 5' X 5' W/ 2 grates	NO BID	→ \$ 1,414.56
	D) 3' X 5' X 6' W/ 2 grates	NO BID	→ \$ 1,559.60
	E) 3' X 5' X 7' W/ 2 grates	NO BID	→ \$ 1,699.09
	F) 3' X 5' X 8' W/ 2 grates	NO BID	→ \$ 1,819.18
	G) TYPE "CC" MOD INLET GRATES 2 PER INLET	NO BID	→ \$ 830.00

RECOMMENDATION →  
 CONTECH Freight - \$1,500 per Truck load

I HEREBY CERTIFY THE ABOVE TO BE THE CORRECT PROPOSALS RECEIVED:

  
 MICHAEL FORBES, PURCHASING AGENT DATE 2/5/19

  
 PAOLINA VEGA - COUNTY ENGINEER DEPT. DATE  
  
 CARLOS REYES PUBLIC WORKS SUPV.

Awarded by Commissioner's Court 2/18/2019

## TABULATION

ANNUAL BIDS # 2520 - ROAD DRAINAGE MATERIALS  
 AS PER BIDS RECEIVED ON JANUARY 29, 2019 AT 11:00 A.M.  
 FROM: MARCH 16, 2019 TO: MARCH 15, 2020 W/OPTION TO RENEW ONCE OR TWICE FOR ONE ADDITIONAL YEAR WITH EACH RENEWAL  
 OPEN MARKET (COST ONLY) PRICE INCREASES ALLOWED

	VENDOR'S NAME ADDRESS DESCRIPTION	CONTECH ENGINEERED SOLUTIONS 232 OAKLAND RD., SCHULENBURG, TX. 78956 (512) 680-1772 PRICE PER EACH	RIO VALLEY PIPE dba CAPA 3609 W. PALMA VISTA DRIVE, PALMVIEW, TX. 78572 (956) 580-2502 PRICE PER EACH
F.	CONCRETE BOX CULVERTS TO CONFORM W/ASTM C-462		
	A) 6' (W) X 6' (H) X 8' (L)	NO BID	→ \$ 2,078.32
	B) 6' (W) X 4' (H) X 8' (L)	NO BID	→ \$ 1,777.20
	C) 8' (W) X 6' (H) X 6' (L)	NO BID	→ \$ 1,918.20
	D) 8' (W) X 4' (H) X 6' (L)	NO BID	→ \$ 1,904.52
	E) 10' (W) X 10' (H) X 6' (L)	NO BID	→ \$ 3,673.62
	F) 10' (W) X 7' (H) X 6' (L)	NO BID	→ \$ 3,056.34
	G) 10' (W) X 6' (H) X 6' (L)	NO BID	→ \$ 3,884.68
	H) 4' (W) X 3' (H) X 8' (L)		→ \$ 921.52

RECOMMENDATION →  
 CONTECH Freight - \$1,500 per Truck load

I HEREBY CERTIFY THE ABOVE TO BE THE CORRECT PROPOSALS RECEIVED:

 \_\_\_\_\_  
 MICHAEL FORBES, PURCHASING AGENT DATE 2/5/19

 \_\_\_\_\_  
 PAOLINA VEGA - COUNTY ENGINEER DEPT. DATE

 \_\_\_\_\_  
 CARLOS REYES PUBLIC WORKS SUPV.

Awarded by Commissioner's Court 2/18/2019

