TABULATION

ANNUAL BID #2560 : ROAD FLEXIBLE BASE MATERIALS
AS PER BIDS RECEIVED ON JANUARY 28, 2019 AT 11:00 AM.

FROM: MARGH 16, 2016 TO: MARCH 15, 2020 W/OPTION TO RENEW ONCE OR TW

OPEN MARKET {COST ONLY) PRICE INCREASES ALLOWED

ICE FOR ONE (1) ADDITIONAL YEAR WITH EACH RENEWAL.,

VENDOR'S NAME GREEN DREAM INTL VULCAN MATERIALS MARTIN MARIETTA FRONTERA MATERIALS
& 2331 MILL RD,, S# 100 P.Q. BOX 781560, 5710 W. HAUSMAN RD,, S# 121 P O, BOX 1449
ADDRESS ALEXANDRIA, VA. 22314 SANANTONIQ, TX 78279 SAN ANTONIQ, TX, 78249 ELSA, TX, 78543
DESCRIFTION (202) 470-4600 (210) 524-3577 (210) 208.4085 ltasa) 316-8962
A, [FLEX . BASE TYPE "E"
CALICHE - GRADE 4
1. ZONE 1 pRTON £13.07 526.16 — $11.60 $12.08
|2, ZONE 2 PRITON 513.07 52706 — §11.80 $12.85
3. ZONE 2 PRITON 514.07 $26.36 —  s1a20 $13.50
4, ZOME 4 [proon | §14.07 $25.30 —=> £13.86 $14.05
| 5.ZONE § [prrron §17.85 $25.30 —y §16.58 516.60
B. |CRUSHED LIMESTONE .
1, ZONE 1 PRITON $67.20 —» $28.15 NO BID NO BID
2, ZONE 2 PRITON $67.20 —+ $27.86 NO BID NOBID
3, ZONE 2 ATON 567.20 —»  126.35 NO BID NC BID
| 4.ZONE 4 prrTON $A7.20 —»  $25.30 NG BID — NOBID
5, ZONE 5§ PRITON $67.20 = $25.30 = NO BID NO BID
RECOMMENDATION BY COUNTY ENGINEER — \.‘/ [ LU\_Q_/ %
PAOLINA VEGA GOUNTY ENGINEER 'DATE
AE/THE CORRECT BIDS RECEIVED:
Lo z2-5-19

e M
GARIOS BEVES PUBLIGINORKS SUPERVISOR oATE
-

Awarded by Commissioner's Court 2/18/2019




